
In order to register for and attend an in-person campus tour, you and all members of your party 
must agree to the following conditions: 

● I understand that only registered individuals up to a total of two per party (including 
myself and one additional guest) are permitted to attend the tour. We are unable to 
accommodate additional unregistered guests unless space becomes available on the day 
of the event. 

● If I am not fully vaccinated, I am required to wear a mask (that covers both my nose 
and mouth) at all times during my campus visit, as will all other unvaccinated members 
in my party. 

● If I am fully vaccinated, I am required to comply with University policy regarding 
mask-wearing, social distancing, and other health and safety guidance based on 
Brown’s Campus Activity Status. As of August 18, 2021, this means I am required to 
wear a mask (that covers both my nose and mouth) indoors during my campus visit. 

● I understand that it is not appropriate to ask any other individual why they are wearing 
a mask, or not. I recognize that no individual will be required to disclose their 
vaccination status to any other visitor and I should not ask anyone else about their 
vaccination status.  

● I recognize that campus tours will not enter buildings to help ensure the health and 
safety of all community members, and I will not request to alter the tour route. 

● I understand that Brown may need to cancel or modify the campus tour for which I am 
registered should public health conditions change in an effort to help ensure the health 
and safety of visitors and the campus community. 

● If I or any member of my party have been diagnosed with or show symptoms of 
COVID-19, or are known to have been in close contact with an individual who meets 
one of those criteria, I will not visit campus until I am cleared to do so by my health 
care provider. 

● I am required to comply with Brown University’s COVID-19 Campus Safety Policy 
during my visit to campus. 

● I will observe the instructions of the Office of College Admission and any Brown 
University officials as directed. 

● I have voluntarily chosen to attend a campus tour and acknowledge that there is a risk 
of exposure to COVID-19 during my visit to campus. I agree to hold Brown University 
harmless for all damages in the event I am exposed to COVID-19 during my visit to 
campus. 

https://healthy.brown.edu/visitors-guests
https://healthy.brown.edu/campus-activity-status
https://policy.brown.edu/policy/covid-19

